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Based on contemporary curricula and feedback from students and instructors, this Seventh Edition has been
thoroughly reorganized, revised, and updated, including six new chapters and a greater emphasis on
evidence-based practice. Coverage includes brand-new or fully revised chapters on nursing values, attitudes,
and self-awareness; the interview and assessment process; inpatient care settings; community/home settings;
forensic psychiatric nursing; suicide and suicidal behavior; somatic therapies; and clients with medical
illnesses. More than thirty new case vignettes with critical thinking questions encourage students to apply
key concepts to practice. Plus, new illustrations, photographs, and special features help different types of
learners understand symptoms, interventions, biologic mechanisms, and the characteristics and needs of
distinct clients.

A companion Website includes an NCLEX® alternate item format tutorial, a Spanish-English audio
glossary, psychotropic drug monographs, free journal articles, NCLEX®-style chapter review questions, and
Clinical Simulation case studies.
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From reader reviews:

Harold Cole:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book you just read? May be the book with the subject Psychiatric-
Mental Health Nursing: Evidence-Based Concepts, Skills and Practices (Point (Lippincott Williams &
Wilkins)) suitable to you? The book was written by renowned writer in this era. Typically the book untitled
Psychiatric-Mental Health Nursing: Evidence-Based Concepts, Skills and Practices (Point (Lippincott
Williams & Wilkins))is one of several books this everyone read now. This particular book was inspired a
number of people in the world. When you read this reserve you will enter the new age that you ever know
just before. The author explained their strategy in the simple way, thus all of people can easily to recognise
the core of this publication. This book will give you a lots of information about this world now. So you can
see the represented of the world on this book.

Lou Morton:

Playing with family inside a park, coming to see the water world or hanging out with close friends is thing
that usually you may have done when you have spare time, then why you don't try point that really opposite
from that. Just one activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster
you are ride on and with addition of information. Even you love Psychiatric-Mental Health Nursing:
Evidence-Based Concepts, Skills and Practices (Point (Lippincott Williams & Wilkins)), you can enjoy both.
It is good combination right, you still would like to miss it? What kind of hang-out type is it? Oh come on its
mind hangout people. What? Still don't obtain it, oh come on its named reading friends.

Willard Griffin:

Is it anyone who having spare time after that spend it whole day by watching television programs or just
lying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Psychiatric-Mental Health Nursing: Evidence-
Based Concepts, Skills and Practices (Point (Lippincott Williams & Wilkins)) can be the answer, oh how
comes? A fresh book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this
brand new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these textbooks have than the others?

Lourdes Tyner:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got students? We believe that that
problem was given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different hobby.
So you know that little person similar to reading or as reading through become their hobby. You must know
that reading is very important along with book as to be the factor. Book is important thing to add you
knowledge, except your own teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update in relation to something
by book. Different categories of books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them are these
claims Psychiatric-Mental Health Nursing: Evidence-Based Concepts, Skills and Practices (Point (Lippincott
Williams & Wilkins)).
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