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Which was the last country to abolish slavery?●

Which is the only amendment to the U.S. Constitution ever to be repealed?●

How did King Henry II of England provide a procedural blueprint for criminal law?●

 
These are just a few of the thought-provoking questions addressed in this beautifully illustrated book. Join
author Michael H. Roffer as he explores 250 of the most fundamental, far-reaching, and often-controversial
cases, laws, and trials that have profoundly changed our world—for good or bad. Offering authoritative
context to ancient documents as well as today’s hot-button issues, The Law Book presents a comprehensive
look at the rules by which we live our lives. It covers such diverse topics as the Code of Hammurabi, the Ten
Commandments, the Trial of Socrates, the Bill of Rights, women’s suffrage, the insanity defense, and more.
Roffer takes us around the globe to ancient Rome and medieval England before transporting us forward to
contemporary accounts that tackle everything from civil rights, surrogacy, and assisted suicide to the 2000
U.S. presidential election, Google Books, and the fight for marriage equality.
 
Organized chronologically, the entries each consist of a short essay and a stunning full-color image, while
the “Notes and Further Reading” section provides resources for more in-depth study. Justice may be blind,
but this collection brings the rich history of the law to light.
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From reader reviews:

Ella Butler:

Do you have favorite book? Should you have, what is your favorite's book? Guide is very important thing for
us to be aware of everything in the world. Each reserve has different aim as well as goal; it means that book
has different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their time for you to read a book. They may be
reading whatever they take because their hobby is reading a book. How about the person who don't like
examining a book? Sometime, particular person feel need book if they found difficult problem or perhaps
exercise. Well, probably you'll have this The Law Book: From Hammurabi to the International Criminal
Court, 250 Milestones in the History of Law (Sterling Milestones).

Stephanie Carlton:

The book The Law Book: From Hammurabi to the International Criminal Court, 250 Milestones in the
History of Law (Sterling Milestones) make you feel enjoy for your spare time. You need to use to make your
capable far more increase. Book can for being your best friend when you getting anxiety or having big
problem using your subject. If you can make reading a book The Law Book: From Hammurabi to the
International Criminal Court, 250 Milestones in the History of Law (Sterling Milestones) to get your habit,
you can get much more advantages, like add your capable, increase your knowledge about a few or all
subjects. You can know everything if you like start and read a guide The Law Book: From Hammurabi to the
International Criminal Court, 250 Milestones in the History of Law (Sterling Milestones). Kinds of book are
several. It means that, science reserve or encyclopedia or some others. So , how do you think about this
reserve?

Phillip Herzog:

Do you considered one of people who can't read gratifying if the sentence chained from the straightway, hold
on guys this kind of aren't like that. This The Law Book: From Hammurabi to the International Criminal
Court, 250 Milestones in the History of Law (Sterling Milestones) book is readable by means of you who
hate the straight word style. You will find the facts here are arrange for enjoyable looking at experience
without leaving perhaps decrease the knowledge that want to provide to you. The writer regarding The Law
Book: From Hammurabi to the International Criminal Court, 250 Milestones in the History of Law (Sterling
Milestones) content conveys the thought easily to understand by many people. The printed and e-book are
not different in the information but it just different available as it. So , do you nonetheless thinking The Law
Book: From Hammurabi to the International Criminal Court, 250 Milestones in the History of Law (Sterling
Milestones) is not loveable to be your top listing reading book?

Sharon Hafer:

A lot of reserve has printed but it differs. You can get it by world wide web on social media. You can choose
the best book for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever simply by searching from it. It is named of book



The Law Book: From Hammurabi to the International Criminal Court, 250 Milestones in the History of Law
(Sterling Milestones). You can include your knowledge by it. Without departing the printed book, it may add
your knowledge and make anyone happier to read. It is most significant that, you must aware about e-book.
It can bring you from one destination to other place.
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