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Whether you’ve finished your manuscript or just have the seeds of a book idea, PUBLISHING 101 shows
you how to approach editors and agents with your work, while avoiding the common pitfalls of first-time
authorship. Experienced editor and publisher Jane Friedman offers insights from more than 15 years of
working on both sides of the desk, and offers step-by-step advice on: • evaluating the commercial potential
for your work • finding and approaching editors and agents professionally • preparing query letters and book
proposal materials • marketing and promoting your work effectively • protecting your rights and avoid
infringing on others’ rights, and • understanding the self-publishing and ebook market—and if it’s the right
path for you. PUBLISHING 101 describes the dramatic changes underway in the publishing industry, as
ebook sales increase and physical bookstores decrease in number. These changes affect how authors get
book deals—meaning you need to be prepared to adapt to a risk-averse industry during a time of uncertainty.
Avoid frustration—don’t embark on the submission process without being fully educated about how the
industry works. You’ll better focus your time and energy, increase your chances of success, and learn to
decipher the language of industry professionals.
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From reader reviews:

Tatum Martin:

Within other case, little people like to read book Publishing 101: A First-Time Author's Guide to Getting
Published, Marketing and Promoting Your Book, and Building a Successful Career. You can choose the best
book if you want reading a book. So long as we know about how is important some sort of book Publishing
101: A First-Time Author's Guide to Getting Published, Marketing and Promoting Your Book, and Building
a Successful Career. You can add understanding and of course you can around the world by the book.
Absolutely right, due to the fact from book you can know everything! From your country until foreign or
abroad you will find yourself known. About simple point until wonderful thing you can know that. In this
era, we can open a book or perhaps searching by internet device. It is called e-book. You need to use it when
you feel bored stiff to go to the library. Let's study.

Ericka McCall:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to perform! A lot of people spent their down time with their family,
or their very own friends. Usually they undertaking activity like watching television, about to beach, or
picnic in the park. They actually doing same task every week. Do you feel it? Do you want to something
different to fill your free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book may be option to fill your cost-free time/
holiday. The first thing that you will ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you want to
try look for book, may be the reserve untitled Publishing 101: A First-Time Author's Guide to Getting
Published, Marketing and Promoting Your Book, and Building a Successful Career can be good book to
read. May be it may be best activity to you.

Robert Frith:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to opt for book like
comic, small story and the biggest an example may be novel. Now, why not striving Publishing 101: A First-
Time Author's Guide to Getting Published, Marketing and Promoting Your Book, and Building a Successful
Career that give your satisfaction preference will be satisfied through reading this book. Reading habit all
over the world can be said as the way for people to know world a great deal better then how they react
towards the world. It can't be stated constantly that reading routine only for the geeky man but for all of you
who wants to be success person. So , for every you who want to start examining as your good habit, you are
able to pick Publishing 101: A First-Time Author's Guide to Getting Published, Marketing and Promoting
Your Book, and Building a Successful Career become your current starter.

Dennis Bales:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information from your book. Book is written or printed or descriptive from each source that filled update of
news. On this modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From



media social such as newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, fresh and comic.
You can add your knowledge by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to spread out your book?
Or just seeking the Publishing 101: A First-Time Author's Guide to Getting Published, Marketing and
Promoting Your Book, and Building a Successful Career when you desired it?
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