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This book starts from the premise that each community chooses its future every day, through the incremental
decisions made by planning and zoning boards and other citizen volunteers, as well as professional staff. The
challenge is to ensure that these decisions support the preservation of what is special about the community,
while still fostering necessary and appropriate growth.

In this volume, twenty-nine experts from a variety of fields describe in very practical terms the "community
preservation" approach to these issues. As opposed to the top-down regulatory mechanisms that are
sometimes used to manage growth, the contributors favor a more flexible, locally based approach that has
proven successful in Massachusetts and elsewhere. They show how residents can be empowered to become
involved in local decision-making, building coalitions and expressing their views on a wide range of issues,
such as zoning, water and land protection, transportation, historic preservation, economic diversity,
affordable housing, and reuse of brown-fields. When done properly, development can enhance the sense of
place and provide needed homes and jobs. Done improperly, it can generate sprawl and a multitude of
problems.

Preserving and Enhancing Communities will be particularly useful to members of planning and other
regulatory boards, as well as students of community planning. The book covers not just typical ways of
doing things, but also the full spectrum of innovative and emerging practices. Each chapter includes
illustrations and case studies, some from Massachusetts and many from other states. The volume concludes
with a set of indicators that communities can use to track their progress in community preservation
and enhancement.
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From reader reviews:

David Smith:

Typically the book Preserving and Enhancing Communities: A Guide for Citizens, Planners, and
Policymakers will bring one to the new experience of reading a new book. The author style to explain the
idea is very unique. When you try to find new book to learn, this book very appropriate to you. The book
Preserving and Enhancing Communities: A Guide for Citizens, Planners, and Policymakers is much
recommended to you to see. You can also get the e-book in the official web site, so you can more readily to
read the book.

David Sayre:

Reading can called mind hangout, why? Because when you are reading a book particularly book entitled
Preserving and Enhancing Communities: A Guide for Citizens, Planners, and Policymakers your mind will
drift away trough every dimension, wandering in each and every aspect that maybe unidentified for but
surely will become your mind friends. Imaging every word written in a reserve then become one web form
conclusion and explanation which maybe you never get previous to. The Preserving and Enhancing
Communities: A Guide for Citizens, Planners, and Policymakers giving you an additional experience more
than blown away your mind but also giving you useful info for your better life in this particular era. So now
let us explain to you the relaxing pattern the following is your body and mind is going to be pleased when
you are finished studying it, like winning an activity. Do you want to try this extraordinary wasting spare
time activity?

Patricia Coburn:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind
ability or thinking skill even analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book compared to
can satisfy your limited time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find book that need
more time to be go through. Preserving and Enhancing Communities: A Guide for Citizens, Planners, and
Policymakers can be your answer mainly because it can be read by you actually who have those short time
problems.

Travis Davis:

It is possible to spend your free time you just read this book this e-book. This Preserving and Enhancing
Communities: A Guide for Citizens, Planners, and Policymakers is simple to create you can read it in the
area, in the beach, train in addition to soon. If you did not possess much space to bring often the printed
book, you can buy typically the e-book. It is make you simpler to read it. You can save the actual book in
your smart phone. And so there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.
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