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America's Girl is an intimate look at the life and trials of Gertrude Ederle, who in 1926 not only became the
first woman to swim across the English Channel, but broke the record set by men. The feat so thrilled
America that it welcomed her home with a ticker tape parade that drew two million people. This fascinating
portrait follows Ederle from her early days as a competitive swimmer through her gold medal triumph at the
1924 Olympics, to the first attempt the next year by Ederle to swim from France to England in frigid and
turbulent waters, a feat that had been conquered by only five men up to that time.

This is also a stirring look at the go-go era of the 1920s, when the country was about to recognize that
women not only could vote, but compete on an international scale as athletes. At the height of Prohibition,
Ederle's triumph over the formidable Channel was a triumph for women everywhere.
America's Girl immerses readers in a pivitol era of American history and brings to life the spirit of that time.

Winner of the 2010 International Swimming Hall of Fame Buck Dawson Authors Award.
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From reader reviews:

Coralee Lowe:

Book is actually written, printed, or descriptive for everything. You can understand everything you want by a
book. Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important matter to bring us around the world.
Beside that you can your reading talent was fluently. A publication America's Girl: The Incredible Story of
How Swimmer Gertrude Ederle Changed the Nation will make you to be smarter. You can feel more
confidence if you can know about everything. But some of you think this open or reading a new book make
you bored. It is far from make you fun. Why they might be thought like that? Have you searching for best
book or ideal book with you?

Gabriel Reyes:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading behavior give
you lot of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge the actual information inside the
book which improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on what kind of e-book you
read, if you want have more knowledge just go with training books but if you want really feel happy read one
along with theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. The America's Girl: The Incredible Story of
How Swimmer Gertrude Ederle Changed the Nation is kind of reserve which is giving the reader capricious
experience.

Irene Wang:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always try to and must have the time or they will get large
amount of stress from both lifestyle and work. So , whenever we ask do people have extra time, we will say
absolutely yes. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity are
there when the spare time coming to anyone of course your answer may unlimited right. Then do you ever
try this one, reading ebooks. It can be your alternative within spending your spare time, the actual book you
have read will be America's Girl: The Incredible Story of How Swimmer Gertrude Ederle Changed the
Nation.

Marcos Hawkins:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our information for everything. By a reserve we can know
everything we really wish for. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every
year has been exactly added. This publication America's Girl: The Incredible Story of How Swimmer
Gertrude Ederle Changed the Nation was filled in relation to science. Spend your time to add your
knowledge about your scientific research competence. Some people has diverse feel when they reading a
new book. If you know how big good thing about a book, you can sense enjoy to read a e-book. In the
modern era like now, many ways to get book which you wanted.
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