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Why do some nations become rich while others remain poor? Traditional mainstream economic growth
theory has done little to answer this question—during most of the twentieth century the theory focused on
models that assumed growth was a simple function of labor, capital, and technology. Through a collection of
case studies from Asia and Africa to Latin America and Europe, Making Poor Nations Rich argues for
examining the critical role entrepreneurs and the institutional environment of private property rights and
economic freedom play in economic development.

Making Poor Nations Rich begins by explaining how entrepreneurs create economic growth and why some
institutional environments encourage more productive entrepreneurship than others. The volume then
addresses countries and regions that have failed to develop because of barriers to entrepreneurship. Finally,
the authors turn to countries that have developed by reforming their institutional environment to protect
private property rights and grant greater levels of economic freedom.

The overall lesson from this volume is clear: pro-market reforms are essential to promoting the productive
entrepreneurship that leads to economic growth. In countries where this institutional environment is lacking,
sustained economic development will remain illusive.
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From reader reviews:

James McFarland:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? E-book is very important thing
for us to be aware of everything in the world. Each book has different aim or perhaps goal; it means that
book has different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. They
can be reading whatever they take because their hobby will be reading a book. Consider the person who don't
like looking at a book? Sometime, particular person feel need book after they found difficult problem or
exercise. Well, probably you will want this Making Poor Nations Rich: Entrepreneurship and the Process of
Economic Development (Stanford Economics and Finance).

Joshua Yoshida:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? That's why,
you can choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their very own spare
time to take a stroll, shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open or perhaps read a book entitled
Making Poor Nations Rich: Entrepreneurship and the Process of Economic Development (Stanford
Economics and Finance)? Maybe it is to become best activity for you. You realize beside you can spend your
time with your favorite's book, you can more intelligent than before. Do you agree with the opinion or you
have some other opinion?

Jeffrey Chambers:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our expertise for everything. By a book we can know everything
we would like. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year seemed to be
exactly added. This reserve Making Poor Nations Rich: Entrepreneurship and the Process of Economic
Development (Stanford Economics and Finance) was filled with regards to science. Spend your spare time to
add your knowledge about your scientific research competence. Some people has diverse feel when they
reading the book. If you know how big benefit of a book, you can sense enjoy to read a e-book. In the
modern era like now, many ways to get book that you simply wanted.

Anthony Koch:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got college students? We believe that that
problem was given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. And
you also know that little person including reading or as reading become their hobby. You have to know that
reading is very important and book as to be the factor. Book is important thing to include you knowledge,
except your personal teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update with regards to something by
book. Many kinds of books that can you take to be your object. One of them is this Making Poor Nations
Rich: Entrepreneurship and the Process of Economic Development (Stanford Economics and Finance).
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