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Michael and Norman play detective with the help of their giant sock-eating pet plants, Stanley and Fluffy.
On a dark and stormy night during a blackout, the book Michael is reading, The Curse of the Evil Ooze,
disappears from right under his nose. Then a valuable plant is stolen. They discover a mysterious footprint
outside their window. With their plants and themselves in danger, the boys solve all the mysteries in this
laugh-loaded adventure.
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From reader reviews:

Angel Garcia:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information today can get by anyone on everywhere.
The information can be a understanding or any news even a problem. What people must be consider any time
those information which is inside the former life are challenging be find than now's taking seriously which
one is acceptable to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you find the unstable resource then
you buy it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All those possibilities will not
happen in you if you take The Mystery of the Plant That Ate Dirty Socks as your daily resource information.

Rodney Bryant:

The particular book The Mystery of the Plant That Ate Dirty Socks will bring someone to the new
experience of reading the book. The author style to explain the idea is very unique. When you try to find new
book to learn, this book very appropriate to you. The book The Mystery of the Plant That Ate Dirty Socks is
much recommended to you to see. You can also get the e-book from official web site, so you can more
readily to read the book.

Gay Swiderski:

The e-book with title The Mystery of the Plant That Ate Dirty Socks has lot of information that you can learn
it. You can get a lot of advantage after read this book. This particular book exist new information the
information that exist in this publication represented the condition of the world at this point. That is
important to yo7u to be aware of how the improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you
throughout new era of the the positive effect. You can read the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read
that anywhere you want.

Aaron Edgington:

As a pupil exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher requested them to go to the library or even
make summary for some reserve, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's soul or real
their hobby. They just do what the educator want, like asked to the library. They go to at this time there but
nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring and can't see colorful
pics on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we know that on this
period, many ways to get whatever we want. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's country.
Therefore this The Mystery of the Plant That Ate Dirty Socks can make you feel more interested to read.
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