
Testing Prayer: Science and Healing
Candy Gunther Brown

Click here if your download doesn"t start automatically

http://sapek.club/go/read.php?id=0674064674
http://sapek.club/go/read.php?id=0674064674
http://sapek.club/go/read.php?id=0674064674


Testing Prayer: Science and Healing

Candy Gunther Brown

Testing Prayer: Science and Healing Candy Gunther Brown

When sickness strikes, people around the world pray for healing. Many of the faithful claim that prayer has
cured them of blindness, deafness, and metastasized cancers, and some believe they have been resurrected
from the dead. Can, and should, science test such claims? A number of scientists say no, concerned that
empirical studies of prayer will be misused to advance religious agendas. And some religious practitioners
agree with this restraint, worrying that scientific testing could undermine faith.

In Candy Gunther Brown’s view, science cannot prove prayer’s healing power, but what scientists can and
should do is study prayer’s measurable effects on health. If prayer produces benefits, even indirectly (and
findings suggest that it does), then more careful attention to prayer practices could impact global health,
particularly in places without access to conventional medicine.

Drawing on data from Pentecostal and Charismatic Christians, Brown reverses a number of stereotypes about
believers in faith-healing. Among them is the idea that poorer, less educated people are more likely to
believe in the healing power of prayer and therefore less likely to see doctors. Brown finds instead that
people across socioeconomic backgrounds use prayer alongside conventional medicine rather than as a
substitute. Dissecting medical records from before and after prayer, surveys of prayer recipients, prospective
clinical trials, and multiyear follow-up observations and interviews, she shows that the widespread
perception of prayer’s healing power has demonstrable social effects, and that in some cases those effects
produce improvements in health that can be scientifically verified.
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From reader reviews:

Gladys Dearth:

Now a day people that Living in the era just where everything reachable by connect to the internet and the
resources inside can be true or not demand people to be aware of each info they get. How people have to be
smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Examining a book
can help persons out of this uncertainty Information particularly this Testing Prayer: Science and Healing
book because this book offers you rich info and knowledge. Of course the details in this book hundred %
guarantees there is no doubt in it you may already know.

Oliver Whitley:

A lot of people always spent their particular free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them
friends and family or their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just
watching TV, as well as playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity here is look
different you can read a new book. It is really fun for yourself. If you enjoy the book which you read you can
spent 24 hours a day to reading a publication. The book Testing Prayer: Science and Healing it is rather good
to read. There are a lot of people who recommended this book. We were holding enjoying reading this book.
Should you did not have enough space to create this book you can buy the particular e-book. You can m0ore
simply to read this book from your smart phone. The price is not to fund but this book provides high quality.

Josie Garcia:

You are able to spend your free time to learn this book this guide. This Testing Prayer: Science and Healing
is simple to deliver you can read it in the area, in the beach, train along with soon. If you did not possess
much space to bring the printed book, you can buy the e-book. It is make you quicker to read it. You can
save typically the book in your smart phone. Thus there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys
this book.

Mary Curtis:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge from it. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is created or printed or created from each source that will filled update of
news. On this modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for a person. From media
social just like newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic. You can
add your knowledge by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just trying to find
the Testing Prayer: Science and Healing when you necessary it?
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