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• AWESOME FACTS ABOUT THE FIFA WORLD CUP: I have intentionally selected a specific range of
“World Cup” facts that I feel will not only help children to learn new information but more importantly,
remember it.

• FUN LEARNING TOOL FOR ALL AGES: This book is designed to capture the imagination of everyone
through the use of "WoW" trivia, cool photos and memory recall quiz.

• COOL & COLORFUL PICTURES: Each page contains a quality image relating to the subject in question.
This helps the reader to match and recall the content.

• INTERACTIVE: To engage and to help hold attention. Some sections require the reader to follow simple
instructions in order to continue to the next level. My way of teaching attention to detail combined with
coordination.

• SHORT QUIZ GAME - POSITIVE REINFORCEMENT: No matter what the score is, everyone's a
WINNER! The purpose of the short quiz at the end is to help check understanding, to cement the information
and to provide a positive conclusion, regardless of the outcome.

Your search for the best “Football/Soccer” book is finally over. When you purchase from me today, here are
just some of the things you can look forward to…..

Amazing and extraordinary “World Cup” facts. This kind of trivia seems to be one of the few things my
memory can actually recall. I'm not sure if it's to do with the shock or the "WoW" factor but for some reason
my brain seems to store at least some of it for a later date.

A fun way of learning. I've always been a great believer in that whatever the subject, if a good teacher can
inspire you and hold your attention, then you'll learn! Now I'm not a teacher but the system I've used in
previous publications on Kindle seems to work well, particularly with children.

A specific selection of those "WoW" facts combined with some pretty awesome pictures, if I say so myself!
Words and images combined to stimulate the brain and absorb the reader using an interactive formula.

At the end there is a short "True or False" quiz to check memory recall. Don't worry though, it's a bit of fun
but at the same time, it helps to check understanding. Remember, “Everyone’s a Winner!



Enjoy ………

Matt.

(5 Gold Star Image (cropped) courtesy of http://tharsikabookblog.blogspot.com.au/)
(Front Cover Image Courtesy of chaskerr4)
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From reader reviews:

Theresa Smith:

This book untitled THE FIFA WORLD CUP: Amazing Football Facts, Awesome Trivia, Cool Pictures &
Fun Soccer Quiz for Kids - The BEST Book Strategy That Helps Guide Children ... Using Their
Imagination!: Sport History to be one of several books that best seller in this year, that's because when you
read this book you can get a lot of benefit in it. You will easily to buy that book in the book shop or you can
order it by using online. The publisher in this book sells the e-book too. It makes you quickly to read this
book, since you can read this book in your Smart phone. So there is no reason to your account to past this
guide from your list.

Felix Talarico:

Do you have something that that suits you such as book? The guide lovers usually prefer to opt for book like
comic, limited story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not seeking THE FIFA WORLD CUP:
Amazing Football Facts, Awesome Trivia, Cool Pictures & Fun Soccer Quiz for Kids - The BEST Book
Strategy That Helps Guide Children ... Using Their Imagination!: Sport History that give your satisfaction
preference will be satisfied through reading this book. Reading habit all over the world can be said as the
opportunity for people to know world far better then how they react in the direction of the world. It can't be
claimed constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky particular person but for all of you who wants to
be success person. So , for all of you who want to start looking at as your good habit, you are able to pick
THE FIFA WORLD CUP: Amazing Football Facts, Awesome Trivia, Cool Pictures & Fun Soccer Quiz for
Kids - The BEST Book Strategy That Helps Guide Children ... Using Their Imagination!: Sport History
become your own starter.

Sandra Kelley:

Don't be worry in case you are afraid that this book may filled the space in your house, you may have it in e-
book means, more simple and reachable. That THE FIFA WORLD CUP: Amazing Football Facts, Awesome
Trivia, Cool Pictures & Fun Soccer Quiz for Kids - The BEST Book Strategy That Helps Guide Children ...
Using Their Imagination!: Sport History can give you a lot of good friends because by you checking out this
one book you have matter that they don't and make you actually more like an interesting person. This
particular book can be one of one step for you to get success. This publication offer you information that
probably your friend doesn't know, by knowing more than different make you to be great folks. So , why
hesitate? Let us have THE FIFA WORLD CUP: Amazing Football Facts, Awesome Trivia, Cool Pictures &
Fun Soccer Quiz for Kids - The BEST Book Strategy That Helps Guide Children ... Using Their
Imagination!: Sport History.



Debra Capone:

E-book is one of source of understanding. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students but native
or citizen will need book to know the upgrade information of year to help year. As we know those textbooks
have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, also can bring us to around the world. From
the book THE FIFA WORLD CUP: Amazing Football Facts, Awesome Trivia, Cool Pictures & Fun Soccer
Quiz for Kids - The BEST Book Strategy That Helps Guide Children ... Using Their Imagination!: Sport
History we can have more advantage. Don't you to definitely be creative people? To become creative person
must love to read a book. Only choose the best book that ideal with your aim. Don't always be doubt to
change your life with that book THE FIFA WORLD CUP: Amazing Football Facts, Awesome Trivia, Cool
Pictures & Fun Soccer Quiz for Kids - The BEST Book Strategy That Helps Guide Children ... Using Their
Imagination!: Sport History. You can more attractive than now.
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