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We all know that we should ask now, before it's too late, before the stories are gone forever. But knowing
and doing are two different things.

Cynthia Hart, author of Cynthia Hart's Scrapbook Workshop, shows exactly how to collect, record, share,
and preserve a family member's or a friend's oral history in this practical and inspirational guide. The Oral
History Workshop breaks down what too often feels like an overwhelming project into a series of easily
manageable steps: how to prepare for an interview; how to become a better listener; why there's always more
beneath the surface and the questions to ask to get there; the pros and cons of video recording, including how
your subjects should dress so the focus is on their words; four steps to keeping the interview on track; how to
be attentive to your subject's energy levels; and the art of archiving or scrapbooking the interview into a
finished keepsake.

At the heart of the book are hundreds of questions designed to cover every aspect of your subject's history:
Do you remember when and how you learned to read? Who in your life showed you the most kindness?
What insights have you gained about your parents over the years? Would you describe yourself as an
optimist or a pessimist? In what ways were you introduced to music? What is the first gift you remember
giving? If you could hold on to one memory forever, what would it be? When the answers are pieced
together, a mosaic appears?a living history.
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From reader reviews:

Doris Moreno:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
Yep, you can choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to
take a go walking, shopping, or went to the actual Mall. How about open or maybe read a book entitled The
Oral History Workshop: Collect and Celebrate the Life Stories of Your Family and Friends? Maybe it is to
become best activity for you. You know beside you can spend your time using your favorite's book, you can
wiser than before. Do you agree with it has the opinion or you have additional opinion?

Richard Pease:

Now a day people that Living in the era where everything reachable by interact with the internet and the
resources inside it can be true or not call for people to be aware of each information they get. How many
people to be smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Looking at a
book can help persons out of this uncertainty Information mainly this The Oral History Workshop: Collect
and Celebrate the Life Stories of Your Family and Friends book since this book offers you rich data and
knowledge. Of course the info in this book hundred % guarantees there is no doubt in it you know.

Donald Worsley:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the concept The Oral History
Workshop: Collect and Celebrate the Life Stories of Your Family and Friends suitable to you? Typically the
book was written by well-known writer in this era. The particular book untitled The Oral History Workshop:
Collect and Celebrate the Life Stories of Your Family and Friendsis the main one of several books which
everyone read now. This book was inspired lots of people in the world. When you read this guide you will
enter the new shape that you ever know before. The author explained their thought in the simple way,
therefore all of people can easily to comprehend the core of this e-book. This book will give you a great deal
of information about this world now. To help you to see the represented of the world within this book.

Ricardo Hayward:

With this era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability in doing something more are more
valuable than other. Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What
you should do is just spending your time not very much but quite enough to possess a look at some books.
Among the books in the top list in your reading list is usually The Oral History Workshop: Collect and
Celebrate the Life Stories of Your Family and Friends. This book which can be qualified as The Hungry
Slopes can get you closer in turning out to be precious person. By looking upwards and review this reserve
you can get many advantages.
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