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When H. P. Blavatsky, the controversial head of the turn of the century movement Theosophy, defined "a
true Theosophist" in her book The Key to Theosophy, she could have just as easily have been describing W.
B. Yeats. Blavatsky writes, "A true Theosophist must put in practice the loftiest moral ideal, must strive to
realize his unity with the whole of humanity, and work ceaselessly for others." Although Yeats joined
Blavatsky's group in 1887, and subsequently left to help form The Golden Dawn in 1890, Yeats's career as
poet and politician were very much in line with the methods set forth by Blavatsky's doctrine. My project
explores how Yeats employs this pop-culture occultism in the creation of his own national literary aesthetic.
This project not only examines the influence theosophy has on the literary work Yeats produced in the late
1880's and 1890's, but also Yeats's work as literary critic and anthology editor during that time. While Yeats
uses theosophy's metaphysical world view to provide an underlying structure for some of his earliest poetry
and drama, he uses theosophy's methods of investigation and argument to discover a metaphysical literary
tradition which incorporates all of his own literary heroes into an Irish cultural tradition. Theosophy provides
a methodology for Yeats to argue that both Shelley and Blake (for example) are part of a tradition that
includes himself. Basing his argument in theosophy, Yeats can argue that the Irish people are a distinct race
with a culture more "sincere" and "natural" than that of England.
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From reader reviews:

Ann Gross:

This book untitled Yeats and Theosophy (Studies in Major Literary Authors) to be one of several books in
which best seller in this year, that's because when you read this book you can get a lot of benefit into it. You
will easily to buy this kind of book in the book store or you can order it via online. The publisher with this
book sells the e-book too. It makes you quickly to read this book, as you can read this book in your Mobile
phone. So there is no reason to your account to past this e-book from your list.

Rene Pina:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With looking at you can get a
lot of information that can give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world may
share their idea. Textbooks can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire all their reader with
their story or their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the guides. But also they write about the
information about something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
children, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors on earth always try to improve their talent
in writing, they also doing some research before they write on their book. One of them is this Yeats and
Theosophy (Studies in Major Literary Authors).

Mary Tiller:

Within this era which is the greater individual or who has ability in doing something more are more precious
than other. Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple solution to have that. What you must do is
just spending your time very little but quite enough to possess a look at some books. One of the books in the
top collection in your reading list is usually Yeats and Theosophy (Studies in Major Literary Authors). This
book which can be qualified as The Hungry Mountains can get you closer in getting precious person. By
looking upwards and review this reserve you can get many advantages.

Grady Comer:

That e-book can make you to feel relax. This specific book Yeats and Theosophy (Studies in Major Literary
Authors) was multi-colored and of course has pictures on the website. As we know that book Yeats and
Theosophy (Studies in Major Literary Authors) has many kinds or category. Start from kids until teenagers.
For example Naruto or Investigation company Conan you can read and believe you are the character on
there. Therefore , not at all of book are generally make you bored, any it offers you feel happy, fun and
loosen up. Try to choose the best book in your case and try to like reading this.
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