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"Hitler was Nazi Germany and Nazi Germany was Hitler." Thus it is often presented. While this perspective
is true to the extent that Hitler's personality, leadership, and ideological convictions played a massive role in
shaping the nature of government and life during the Third Reich, the perspective has led most writers since
the end of World War II to ignore other aspects of Nazism in favor of biographies or historical works
centered solely around Hitler's contributions to the Nazi Party. This book seeks to fill a significant gap in the
literature by concentrating particularly on the Nazi Party and its growth during the years of the Weimar
Republic, examining the paramilitary presence in Germany and Bavaria after World War I. Most of the book
concentrates on the development of the Nazi Storm Detachment (Sturmabteilung, or SA) before and after the
failed Beer Hall Putsch in 1923. By the time Hitler came to power in January 1932, there were perhaps as
many as 400,000 of these brown-shirted men creating violence on a daily basis and destroying the shaky
underpinnings of the Weimar Republic. These young storm troopers, often self-styled revolutionaries, made
unparalleled contributions to the ascendancy of the Nazi Party and Hitler's explosive rise to power. The book
features several photographs captured from the Nazi Party's Central Publishing Facility in Munich and
passed to the author in the late 1950s.
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From reader reviews:

Floretta Simmons:

What do you about book? It is not important along? Or just adding material when you really need something
to explain what the one you have problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy particular person? If
you don't have spare time to complete others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have spare
time? What did you do? Everybody has many questions above. They need to answer that question because
just their can do that. It said that about reserve. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is right. Because start
from on pre-school until university need this kind of Hitler's Stormtroopers and the Attack on the German
Republic, 1919-1933 to read.

Stephanie Matias:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation as well as go to the outside with them household or
their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, or maybe playing
video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity here is look different you can read a
book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book that you read you can spent the entire day to reading a
reserve. The book Hitler's Stormtroopers and the Attack on the German Republic, 1919-1933 it doesn't
matter what good to read. There are a lot of folks that recommended this book. They were enjoying reading
this book. When you did not have enough space to bring this book you can buy typically the e-book. You can
m0ore easily to read this book out of your smart phone. The price is not to cover but this book features high
quality.

Marvin Murphy:

Many people spending their time period by playing outside using friends, fun activity with family or just
watching TV all day every day. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by reading through a
book. Ugh, ya think reading a book can actually hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It
alright you can have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like Hitler's
Stormtroopers and the Attack on the German Republic, 1919-1933 which is keeping the e-book version. So ,
try out this book? Let's see.

Chad Steinberger:

A lot of e-book has printed but it differs. You can get it by online on social media. You can choose the most
beneficial book for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is referred to as of
book Hitler's Stormtroopers and the Attack on the German Republic, 1919-1933. You can add your
knowledge by it. Without departing the printed book, it could possibly add your knowledge and make you
happier to read. It is most essential that, you must aware about e-book. It can bring you from one spot to
other place.
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