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Police chief of a small Massachusetts town, Cameron McDonald makes the toughest arrest of his life when
his own cousin Jamie comes to him and confesses outright that he has killed his terminally ill wife out of
mercy.

Now, a heated murder trial plunges the town into upheaval, and drives a wedge into a contented marriage:
Cameron, aiding the prosecution in their case against Jamie, is suddenly at odds with his devoted wife, Allie
-- seduced by the idea of a man so in love with his wife that he'd grant all her wishes, even her wish to end
her life. And when an inexplicable attraction leads to a shocking betrayal, Allie faces the hardest questions of
the heart: when does love cross the line of moral obligation? And what does it mean to truly love another?

Praised for her "personal, detail-rich style" (Glamour), Jodi Picoult infuses this page-turning novel with
heart, warmth, and startling candor, taking readers on an unforgettable emotional journey.
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From reader reviews:

James Mendoza:

The book Mercy can give more knowledge and information about everything you want. Exactly why must
we leave a very important thing like a book Mercy? Several of you have a different opinion about e-book.
But one aim that will book can give many facts for us. It is absolutely right. Right now, try to closer using
your book. Knowledge or details that you take for that, you may give for each other; it is possible to share all
of these. Book Mercy has simple shape however, you know: it has great and large function for you. You can
look the enormous world by wide open and read a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

Maria Carlin:

This book untitled Mercy to be one of several books that best seller in this year, this is because when you
read this e-book you can get a lot of benefit onto it. You will easily to buy this kind of book in the book retail
store or you can order it by using online. The publisher of the book sells the e-book too. It makes you quickly
to read this book, as you can read this book in your Touch screen phone. So there is no reason to you to past
this guide from your list.

Willie Grajeda:

The book with title Mercy includes a lot of information that you can learn it. You can get a lot of profit after
read this book. This specific book exist new information the information that exist in this publication
represented the condition of the world today. That is important to yo7u to learn how the improvement of the
world. This specific book will bring you throughout new era of the globalization. You can read the e-book in
your smart phone, so you can read the item anywhere you want.

Holly Hughes:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you, why because this Mercy book written by well-known writer we
are excited for well how to make book that may be understand by anyone who read the book. Written in
good manner for you, still dripping wet every ideas and writing skill only for eliminate your personal hunger
then you still uncertainty Mercy as good book but not only by the cover but also by content. This is one
publication that can break don't assess book by its include, so do you still needing a different sixth sense to
pick this particular!? Oh come on your looking at sixth sense already said so why you have to listening to a
different sixth sense.
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