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JUNOS Enterprise Switching is the only detailed technical book on Juniper Networks' new Ethernet-
switching EX product platform. With this book, you'll learn all about the hardware and ASIC design prowess
of the EX platform, as well as the JUNOS Software that powers it. Not only is this extremely practical book
a useful, hands-on manual to the EX platform, it also makes an excellent study guide for certification exams
in the JNTCP enterprise tracks.

The authors have based JUNOS Enterprise Switching on their own Juniper training practices and programs,
as well as the configuration, maintenance, and troubleshooting guidelines they created for their bestselling
companion book, JUNOS Enterprise Routing. Using a mix of test cases, case studies, use cases, and
tangential answers to real-world problems, this book covers:

Enterprise switching and virtual LANs (VLANs)●

The Spanning tree protocol and why it's needed●

Inter-VLAN routing, including route tables and preferences●

Routing policy and firewall filters●

Switching security, such as DHCP snooping●

Telephony integration, including VLAN voice●

Part of the Juniper Networks Technical Library<™>, JUNOS Enterprise Switching provides all-inclusive
coverage of the Juniper Networks EX product platform, including architecture and packet flow, management
options, user interface options, and complete details on JUNOS switch deployment.
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From reader reviews:

Federico Crouch:

What do you think of book? It is just for students since they are still students or the idea for all people in the
world, what the best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that concern above. Every person has
distinct personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that they don't
desire do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book JUNOS Enterprise Switching. All
type of book could you see on many methods. You can look for the internet sources or other social media.

Linda Pinkerton:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive currently,
people have do something to make these survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place and
notice by surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated that for a while is
reading. That's why, by reading a guide your ability to survive raise then having chance to endure than other
is high. In your case who want to start reading a new book, we give you this JUNOS Enterprise Switching
book as starter and daily reading book. Why, because this book is usually more than just a book.

Peter Burnett:

Beside this JUNOS Enterprise Switching in your phone, it may give you a way to get nearer to the new
knowledge or info. The information and the knowledge you will got here is fresh in the oven so don't end up
being worry if you feel like an outdated people live in narrow town. It is good thing to have JUNOS
Enterprise Switching because this book offers for you readable information. Do you often have book but you
don't get what it's exactly about. Oh come on, that won't happen if you have this inside your hand. The
Enjoyable set up here cannot be questionable, including treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to
miss the item? Find this book and read it from now!

Carole Houston:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got learners? We believe that that question was
given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. And also you
know that little person similar to reading or as studying become their hobby. You must know that reading is
very important along with book as to be the factor. Book is important thing to include you knowledge, except
your teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update about something by book. A substantial number of
sorts of books that can you go onto be your object. One of them is this JUNOS Enterprise Switching.
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