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A totally revised new edition of the bestselling guide to business school basics

The bestselling book that invented the "MBA in a book" category, The Portable MBA Fifth Edition is a
reliable and information-packed guide to the business school curriculum and experience. For years,
professionals who need MBA-level information and insight-but don't need the hassle of business school-have
turned to the Portable MBA series for the very best, most up-to-date coverage of the business basics.

This new revised and expanded edition continues that long tradition with practical, real-world business
insight from faculty members from the prestigious Darden School at the University of Virginia. With 50
percent new material, including new chapters on such topics as emerging economies, enterprise risk
management, consumer behavior, managing teams, and up-to-date career advice, this is the best Portable
MBA ever.

Covers all the core topics you'd learn in business school, including finance, accounting, marketing,●

economics, ethics, operations management, management and leadership, and strategy.
Every chapter is totally updated and seven new chapters have been added on vital business topics●

Includes case studies and interactive web-based examples●

Whether you own your own small business or work in a major corporate office, The Portable MBA gives you
the comprehensive information and rich understanding of the business world that you need.
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From reader reviews:

Frank Lantz:

The book The Portable MBA can give more knowledge and information about everything you want. Exactly
why must we leave the good thing like a book The Portable MBA? Wide variety you have a different opinion
about guide. But one aim in which book can give many facts for us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right now,
try to closer using your book. Knowledge or details that you take for that, you could give for each other; it is
possible to share all of these. Book The Portable MBA has simple shape however, you know: it has great and
big function for you. You can seem the enormous world by start and read a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

Robert Nguyen:

The Portable MBA can be one of your basic books that are good idea. All of us recommend that straight
away because this reserve has good vocabulary that may increase your knowledge in vocab, easy to
understand, bit entertaining however delivering the information. The copy writer giving his/her effort to get
every word into enjoyment arrangement in writing The Portable MBA yet doesn't forget the main level,
giving the reader the hottest and based confirm resource information that maybe you can be one of it. This
great information can easily drawn you into completely new stage of crucial considering.

Charles Carey:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information much
easier to share. You can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and
soon. You will observe that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. Typically the book that
recommended for you is The Portable MBA this reserve consist a lot of the information in the condition of
this world now. That book was represented how do the world has grown up. The vocabulary styles that
writer use for explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some exploration when he makes this
book. Honestly, that is why this book ideal all of you.

Donnie Matthews:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information from
the book. Book is composed or printed or highlighted from each source that filled update of news. With this
modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for you. From media social like
newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and comic. You can add your
knowledge by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just looking for the
The Portable MBA when you essential it?
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