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America is drifting headlong into Socialism, with millions believing that they should be cared for by the
State. Like never before we need a clarion call of warning to stop this drift, and stop it now. So,what does
Jesus Christ have to do with John Galt? This book addresses that question with lively quotations and
dialogue from Atlas Shrugged and the Bible and discussion of hot topics like individualism, collectivism,
progressivism, egoism, altruism, money, sacrifice, sexuality, friendship, and Utopian dreams for an ideal
society. A companion book to readers (and would-be) of Ayn Rand, Christian and atheist alike will find
something here. Read Atlas Shrugged and this book together to understand the issues and check your
premises About the Authors: Chad Brand is Professor of Christian Theology at the Southern Baptist
Theological Seminary and is Associate Dean for Biblical and Theological Studies at Boyce College, both in
Louisville, KY. He is co-editor of the Holman Illustrated Bible Dictionary and the Apologetics Study Bible,
is co-author (with Tom Pratt) of Seeking the City, forthcoming (Kregel Publishers), and is author of
Flourishing Faith: Connecting Work, Economics and Civic Responsibility in Baptist Faith and Life (Acton
Institute). Tom Pratt is an pastor, teacher, writer, businessman with 40 years experience in the ministry and
Bible teaching in the Denver, CO area, South Carolina, and Texas. He is co-author with Chad Brand oF the
comprehensive book on Christian faith and political economy, Seeking the City and the e-book soon on
Amazon, Awaiting the City.
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From reader reviews:

Charles Lee:

Book is written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a e-book.
Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important matter to bring us around the world.
Next to that you can your reading skill was fluently. A e-book Clash of Titans: Atlas Shrugged, John Galt &
Jesus Christ will make you to be smarter. You can feel a lot more confidence if you can know about
anything. But some of you think that open or reading the book make you bored. It is not necessarily make
you fun. Why they are often thought like that? Have you looking for best book or suited book with you?

Jeffery Harman:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be up-date about what going on or information even
knowledge to make these people keep up with the era and that is always change and advance. Some of you
maybe will probably update themselves by examining books. It is a good choice to suit your needs but the
problems coming to a person is you don't know which one you should start with. This Clash of Titans: Atlas
Shrugged, John Galt & Jesus Christ is our recommendation to make you keep up with the world. Why,
because this book serves what you want and need in this era.

Rose Davies:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading behavior give you
lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information inside the
book this improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on what kind of guide you read,
if you want get more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want truly feel happy read one along
with theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. The actual Clash of Titans: Atlas Shrugged, John Galt &
Jesus Christ is kind of reserve which is giving the reader unpredictable experience.

Bruce Davis:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you actually, why because this Clash of Titans: Atlas Shrugged,
John Galt & Jesus Christ publication written by well-known writer who knows well how to make book that
may be understand by anyone who all read the book. Written throughout good manner for you, still dripping
wet every ideas and writing skill only for eliminate your own hunger then you still doubt Clash of Titans:
Atlas Shrugged, John Galt & Jesus Christ as good book not simply by the cover but also through the content.
This is one reserve that can break don't evaluate book by its deal with, so do you still needing another sixth
sense to pick that!? Oh come on your looking at sixth sense already alerted you so why you have to listening
to an additional sixth sense.
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