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In the 1860s, William Mumler photographed ghosts—or so he claimed. Faint images of the dearly departed
lurked in the background with the living, like his well-known photo of the recently assassinated Abraham
Lincoln comforting Mary Todd. The practice came to be known as spirit photography, and some believed
Mumler was channeling the dead. Skeptics, however, called it a fraudulent trick on the gullible, taking
advantage of the grieving at a time of suffering and loss. Mumler’s insistence that his work brought back the
dead led to a sensational trial in 1869 that was the talk of the nation.

In The Strange Case of William Mumler, Spirit Photographer, Louis Kaplan brings together, for the first
time, Mumler’s haunting images, his revealing memoir, and rich primary sources, including newspaper
articles and P. T. Barnum’s famous indictment of Mumler in Humbugs of the World. Kaplan also contributes
two extended essays, which offer a historical perspective of the Mumler phenomena and delve into the
sociocultural and theoretical issues surrounding this vivid ghost story.

Mumler’s case was an early example of investigative journalism intersecting with a criminal trial that, at its
essence, set science against religion. The Strange Case of William Mumler, Spirit Photographer is the
definitive resource for this unique and fascinating moment in American history and provides insights into
today’s ghosts in the machine.
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From reader reviews:

Alison McGowan:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children until eventually adult are different content. As you may
know that book is very important for us. The book The Strange Case of William Mumler, Spirit
Photographer (Fesler-Lampert Minnesota Heritage Books) has been making you to know about other
expertise and of course you can take more information. It is extremely advantages for you. The e-book The
Strange Case of William Mumler, Spirit Photographer (Fesler-Lampert Minnesota Heritage Books) is not
only giving you more new information but also for being your friend when you really feel bored. You can
spend your own spend time to read your e-book. Try to make relationship while using book The Strange
Case of William Mumler, Spirit Photographer (Fesler-Lampert Minnesota Heritage Books). You never really
feel lose out for everything should you read some books.

Larry Swartz:

The particular book The Strange Case of William Mumler, Spirit Photographer (Fesler-Lampert Minnesota
Heritage Books) has a lot of knowledge on it. So when you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of
benefit. The book was compiled by the very famous author. The author makes some research before write
this book. This specific book very easy to read you can find the point easily after looking over this book.

Robert Hicks:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the spare time or they will get
wide range of stress from both lifestyle and work. So , if we ask do people have extra time, we will say
absolutely yes. People is human not really a robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity are you
experiencing when the spare time coming to anyone of course your answer will probably unlimited right.
Then do you try this one, reading ebooks. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time, the book
you have read is usually The Strange Case of William Mumler, Spirit Photographer (Fesler-Lampert
Minnesota Heritage Books).

Harold Houston:

The book untitled The Strange Case of William Mumler, Spirit Photographer (Fesler-Lampert Minnesota
Heritage Books) contain a lot of information on this. The writer explains your ex idea with easy method. The
language is very simple to implement all the people, so do certainly not worry, you can easy to read this. The
book was authored by famous author. The author will bring you in the new age of literary works. It is
possible to read this book because you can please read on your smart phone, or program, so you can read the
book in anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can open their official
web-site along with order it. Have a nice go through.
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