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Leviticus used to be the first book that Jewish children studied in the synagogue. In the modern church it
tends to be the last part of the Bible that anyone looks at seriously. Because Leviticus is largely concerned
with subjects that seem incomprehensible and irrelevant today — rituals for sacrifice and regulations
concerning uncleanness — it appears to have nothing to say to twenty-first-century Christians. In this
excellent commentary on Leviticus, Gordon Wenham takes with equal seriousness both the plain original
meaning of the text and its abiding theological value. To aid in reconstructing the original meaning of the
text, Wenham draws from studies of Old Testament ritual and sacrifice that compare and contrast biblical
customs with the practices of other Near Eastern cultures. He also closely examines the work of social
anthropologists and expertly utilizes the methods of literary criticism to bring out the biblical author’s special
interests. In pursuit of his second aim, to illumine the enduring theological value of Leviticus, Wenham
discusses at the end of each section how the Old Testament passages relate to the New Testament and to
contemporary Christianity. In doing so, he not only shows how pervasive Levitical ideas are in the New
Testament but also highlights in very practical ways the enduring claim of God’s call to holiness on the lives
of Christians today.
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From reader reviews:

Cory Denton:

In other case, little men and women like to read book The Book of Leviticus (The New International
Commentary on the Old Testament). You can choose the best book if you want reading a book. Provided that
we know about how is important the book The Book of Leviticus (The New International Commentary on
the Old Testament). You can add know-how and of course you can around the world by a book. Absolutely
right, mainly because from book you can recognize everything! From your country until eventually foreign
or abroad you may be known. About simple matter until wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, we
can open a book or maybe searching by internet device. It is called e-book. You need to use it when you feel
weary to go to the library. Let's examine.

Brett Munoz:

Do you considered one of people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained from the straightway, hold
on guys that aren't like that. This The Book of Leviticus (The New International Commentary on the Old
Testament) book is readable simply by you who hate those perfect word style. You will find the details here
are arrange for enjoyable studying experience without leaving perhaps decrease the knowledge that want to
supply to you. The writer connected with The Book of Leviticus (The New International Commentary on the
Old Testament) content conveys the thought easily to understand by lots of people. The printed and e-book
are not different in the content but it just different in the form of it. So , do you continue to thinking The
Book of Leviticus (The New International Commentary on the Old Testament) is not loveable to be your top
list reading book?

Amos Curley:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information today can get by anyone on everywhere.
The information can be a knowledge or any news even an issue. What people must be consider any time
those information which is in the former life are hard to be find than now could be taking seriously which
one is suitable to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you have the unstable resource then you
buy it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you. All those possibilities will not
happen inside you if you take The Book of Leviticus (The New International Commentary on the Old
Testament) as your daily resource information.

Yvonne Webb:

A number of people said that they feel fed up when they reading a publication. They are directly felt the idea
when they get a half regions of the book. You can choose the actual book The Book of Leviticus (The New
International Commentary on the Old Testament) to make your current reading is interesting. Your own skill
of reading ability is developing when you just like reading. Try to choose simple book to make you enjoy to
study it and mingle the opinion about book and studying especially. It is to be 1st opinion for you to like to



available a book and examine it. Beside that the reserve The Book of Leviticus (The New International
Commentary on the Old Testament) can to be a newly purchased friend when you're really feel alone and
confuse in what must you're doing of this time.
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