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For his keen social insight, glib sophistication, and breathtaking lyricism, F. Scott Fitzgerald stands as one of
the most important American writers of the twentieth century. His biographers all note the importance of his
boyhood in St. Paul, where, as he put it, he lived in "a house below the average on a street above the
average." Fitzgerald?s sensitivity about wealth and position?later made evident in such classics as The Great
Gatsby and Tender is the Night--was bred of his St. Paul family and associations. F. Scott Fitzgerald?s St.
Paul is a city of winter dreams and ice palaces, lakeside parties and neighborhood hijinks. These are stories
of ambition and young love, insecurity and awkwardness, where a poor boy with energy and intelligence can
break into the upper classes and become a glittering success. This selection brings together the best of
Fitzgerald's St. Paul stories?some virtually unknown, others classics of short fiction. Patricia Hampl's
incisive introduction traces the trajectory of Fitzgerald?s blazing celebrity and its connections to his life in
the city that gave him his best material. Headnotes by Dave Page provide specific ties between the stories
and Fitzgerald?s life in St. Paul. "Fitzgerald is a presence in St. Paul, a ghost who patrols his old
neighborhood and keeps talking to us. He sits on Mrs. Porterfield?s porch on Summit Avenue, smoking and
talking about writing, and it is always that gorgeous summer just before he finished the book, hit it big, went
to New York, married the girl. This lovely book sets out our claim on him. We have no Fitzgerald museum
in St. Paul, no boyhood home restored--the family lived in apartments--but this book is the only monument
he needs, his own stories, with historical notes, and Patricia Hampl's graceful shining essay for absolution,
and Zelda?s benediction." -- Garrison Keillor "These are wonderful stories, including several of the greatest
Fitzgerald ever wrote. Anyone interested in Fitzgerald or the importance of place in fiction will want to read
this book. And anyone who does will find it a delight." -- Scott Donaldson, author of Hemingway vs.
Fitzgerald "In one of the ironies of fate of which life is so fond, the literary world knows the biography and
work of F. Scott Fitzgerald better than it knows the particulars of the city where he was born. Fitzgerald
loved, hated, and was obsessed by St. Paul, and in her brilliant introduction to these stories, Patricia Hampl
shows us why. These stories and this wonderfully informative introduction give St. Paul a local habitation
and a name, and they place Fitzgerald?s ambitions and gifts in a cultural context too often ignored or
forgotten." -- Charles Baxter, author of Saul and Patsy
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From reader reviews:

Gary Bloomfield:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children till adult are different content. As it is known to us that
book is very important usually. The book St Paul Stories of F Scott Fitzgerald had been making you to know
about other expertise and of course you can take more information. It doesn't matter what advantages for
you. The book St Paul Stories of F Scott Fitzgerald is not only giving you much more new information but
also for being your friend when you really feel bored. You can spend your spend time to read your reserve.
Try to make relationship using the book St Paul Stories of F Scott Fitzgerald. You never sense lose out for
everything in the event you read some books.

James Goodman:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With examining you can get a lot of
information that could give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world can easily
share their idea. Guides can also inspire a lot of people. Many author can inspire their reader with their story
or maybe their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the publications. But also they write about the
ability about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
young ones, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors these days always try to
improve their skill in writing, they also doing some investigation before they write on their book. One of
them is this St Paul Stories of F Scott Fitzgerald.

Nora Emerson:

Do you like reading a publication? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book ended up being
rare? Why so many issue for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy with regard to reading.
Some people likes reading through, not only science book and also novel and St Paul Stories of F Scott
Fitzgerald or others sources were given know-how for you. After you know how the truly great a book, you
feel want to read more and more. Science guide was created for teacher or maybe students especially. Those
books are helping them to include their knowledge. In some other case, beside science guide, any other book
likes St Paul Stories of F Scott Fitzgerald to make your spare time much more colorful. Many types of book
like this one.

Vincent Olson:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher requested them to go to the library as well as to
make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's internal or real
their hobby. They just do what the trainer want, like asked to the library. They go to generally there but
nothing reading really. Any students feel that reading is not important, boring as well as can't see colorful
images on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very important for yourself. As we know that on
this period, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, many ways to reach Chinese's
country. Therefore , this St Paul Stories of F Scott Fitzgerald can make you sense more interested to read.
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