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Tommy Newberry's best-selling Success Is Not an Accident (self-published in 1999) has helped over 100,000
readers achieve higher levels of success in both their personal and professional lives. Reminiscent of best-
selling authors Stephen Covey and John Maxwell, Newberry teaches readers the power of goal setting, time
management, visualization, and “self-talk” so they can achieve peak levels of performance in all areas of
their lives.
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From reader reviews:

Sara Otoole:

What do you consider book? It is just for students because they are still students or this for all people in the
world, what best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that problem above. Every person has
different personality and hobby per other. Don't to be obligated someone or something that they don't want
do that. You must know how great and also important the book Success Is Not an Accident: Change Your
Choices; Change Your Life. All type of book would you see on many options. You can look for the internet
solutions or other social media.

Sylvia Langley:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading routine give
you lot of advantages. The advantages you got of course the knowledge your information inside the book this
improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what kind of e-book you read, if you
want drive more knowledge just go with education books but if you want experience happy read one with
theme for entertaining like comic or novel. The Success Is Not an Accident: Change Your Choices; Change
Your Life is kind of guide which is giving the reader unstable experience.

Belinda Smith:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information currently can get by anyone on
everywhere. The information can be a know-how or any news even a problem. What people must be
consider whenever those information which is inside the former life are difficult to be find than now's taking
seriously which one is appropriate to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you receive
the unstable resource then you understand it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for
you. All of those possibilities will not happen inside you if you take Success Is Not an Accident: Change
Your Choices; Change Your Life as the daily resource information.

Larisa Nagle:

A number of people said that they feel bored stiff when they reading a publication. They are directly felt the
idea when they get a half parts of the book. You can choose the particular book Success Is Not an Accident:
Change Your Choices; Change Your Life to make your own personal reading is interesting. Your personal
skill of reading talent is developing when you including reading. Try to choose easy book to make you enjoy
to see it and mingle the impression about book and reading especially. It is to be first opinion for you to like
to wide open a book and learn it. Beside that the book Success Is Not an Accident: Change Your Choices;
Change Your Life can to be a newly purchased friend when you're sense alone and confuse with what must
you're doing of this time.
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