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This most comprehensive and detailed full-color pocket field guide includes everything needed to correctly
identify 73 species of North American waterfowl and game birds. Chris Smith, a widely-known artist,
provides excellent full color illustrations that detail every important aspect of each bird, from grouse and
quail to puddle ducks and divers. You will find 23 upland game birds and 50 waterfowl and shore birds with
detailed full color illustrations, distribution and flyway maps for each species, as well as thorough
descriptions covering special features of identification, habitat, breeding habits, vocalizations, and flock
information for waterfowl. Special features of identification are also illustrated, including the wings of each
waterfowl species and how to identify between the male and female of game birds and waterfowl. It is
printed on water-resistant paper and will fit in you bird vest or waterfowl parka.
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From reader reviews:

Margaret Morales:

Do you have favorite book? When you have, what is your favorite's book? E-book is very important thing for
us to learn everything in the world. Each guide has different aim as well as goal; it means that publication
has different type. Some people sense enjoy to spend their a chance to read a book. They are reading
whatever they have because their hobby is reading a book. Consider the person who don't like reading a
book? Sometime, particular person feel need book when they found difficult problem or maybe exercise.
Well, probably you will want this Field Guide to Upland Birds and Waterfowl (A Wilderness Adventures
Field Guide).

Anita Rodriguez:

The e-book untitled Field Guide to Upland Birds and Waterfowl (A Wilderness Adventures Field Guide) is
the book that recommended to you to learn. You can see the quality of the publication content that will be
shown to you actually. The language that author use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The
article author was did a lot of investigation when write the book, hence the information that they share for
your requirements is absolutely accurate. You also could get the e-book of Field Guide to Upland Birds and
Waterfowl (A Wilderness Adventures Field Guide) from the publisher to make you much more enjoy free
time.

Kayla Congdon:

Is it you who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day by means of watching television programs
or just lying on the bed? Do you need something new? This Field Guide to Upland Birds and Waterfowl (A
Wilderness Adventures Field Guide) can be the respond to, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are
and so out of date, spending your time by reading in this brand new era is common not a geek activity. So
what these textbooks have than the others?

Yolanda Sartain:

As a university student exactly feel bored for you to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the
library as well as to make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just small students that has
reading's heart or real their leisure activity. They just do what the educator want, like asked to go to the
library. They go to generally there but nothing reading really. Any students feel that studying is not
important, boring and also can't see colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very
important for yourself. As we know that on this time, many ways to get whatever we really wish for.
Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's country. Therefore this Field Guide to Upland Birds and
Waterfowl (A Wilderness Adventures Field Guide) can make you truly feel more interested to read.
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